
Sun Mon Tue Wed Thu Fri Sat 

    1 
Pray for Susan as she 
finishes her last week in 
US before returning to 
Israel June 6.  Pray for 
God’s leading 

2 
Pray and stand with 
AHI for an increase in 
funds to continue the 
work for the Survivors -
even to the last one. 
 
 

3 
Give thanksgiving for 
new people joining AHI 
staff and board. Pray for 
more workers! 

4 
Pray for Sgt. Maj     
Warren Lyon as he 
makes contacts with the 
Veteran groups to work 
with Survivors, with 
AHI. 

5 
Pray for volunteer office 
personnel needed both 
for US and Israel work. 
 
 

6 
Pray for Susan as she 
flies to Israel today.  
The flight is about 12 
hrs arriving June 7.  
Pray for her to arrive 
rested and ready to go! 
 

7 
Pray AHI can purchase 
a van.  We need 52,000 
shekels equal in dollars 
to $14,900.   

8 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Afula, Modiin, Ramle 
and Tel Aviv. 

9 
Pray for Survivors who 
lost their spouse this 
month to find the com-
fort offered them by 
HaShem 
 
 

10 
Pray for Survivors to 
have dreams from Ha-
Shem so they hear His 
voice themselves. 

11 
Pray for partners to join 
AHI in sponsoring the 
Survivor videos on the 
Russian speaking TBN 
Russia.  We need $2500 
each month. 

12 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Petach Tikva, Haifa and 
Jerusalem. 

13 
Pray for increased book 
sales of “Why is Great-
Grandma So Sad?” 
which benefits the   
Survivor work. 

14 
Pray for safe arrival of 
college students coming 
to do an internship with 
AHI and the Survivors. 

15 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Nahariya, Migdal ha 
Emek, Tzfat, Karmiel 
and Kiryat Yam. 

16 
Give thanks for the 
government agencies 
that work with AHI like 
the Dept of Welfare and 
Ministry Office. 

17 
Pray for children of 
Survivors to feel a great 
“need” to visit their 
parents today; for    
restoration in their  
families. 

18 
Pray for the families of 
each AHI board and 
staff members, for   
safety and protection. 

19 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Rishon le Zion, Kiryat 
Bialik and Beit Shean 

18 
Pray for favor and grace 
as we bring Veterans to 
meet Survivors.  Pray 
for healing through new 
relationships. 

21 
Pray for sponsors to 
take on the monthly 
cost of translation for 
the Russian & Hebrew 
Survivor videos, into 
English.  We need $300 
per month. 

22 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Neszioyona, Kiryat 
Motzkin and Bnai’ 
Brak. 

23 
Give thanks for the  
Volunteers who come to 
Israel and love on the 
Survivors. 

24 
Pray for Survivors who 
are having difficulty 
sleeping or cannot   
handle the trauma due 
to PTSD. 

25 
Pray for the Christian 
church to have a new 
revelation: Israel has 
not been replaced but 
remains #1. 

26 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Akko, Arad, Ashdod, 
Kiryat Chaim and Bat 
Yam 

27 
Pray for AHI staff and 
volunteers to hear God’s 
voice clearly so we can 
follow His Heart and 
plans. 

28 
Pray for investors who 
will support the work 
with Survivors while we 
still have time to spend 
with  them. 

29 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Beer Sheva, Nazareth 
Ilit and Ashquelon. 

30 
Pray for Survivors to 
wish to know, have a 
desire to hear, how 
much HaShem loves 
them. 
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Sun Mon Tue Wed Thu Fri Sat 

      1 
Give thanksgiving for 
new people joining AHI 
staff and board. Pray for 
more workers! 

2Pray for Sgt. Maj       
Warren Lyon as he 
makes contacts with the 
Veteran groups to work 
with Survivors, with 
AHI. 

3 
Pray AHI can purchase 
a van.  We need 52,000 
shekels equal in dollars 
to $14,900.   

4 
Pray for increase in 
translators of various 
languages so we can 
speak to more           
Survivors. 

5 
Pray for partners to join 
AHI in sponsoring the 
Survivor videos on the 
Russian speaking TBN 
Russia.  We need $2500 

6 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Afula, Modiin, Ramle 
and Tel Aviv. 

7 
Pray for Survivors who 
lost their spouse this 
month to find the com-
fort offered them by 
HaShem 

8 
Pray for Survivors to 
have dreams from Ha-
Shem so they hear His 
voice themselves. 

9 
Pray for volunteer office 
personnel needed both 
for US and Israel work. 
 

10 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Petach Tikva, Haifa and 
Jerusalem. 

11 
Pray for increased book 
sales of “Why is Great-
Grandma So Sad?” 
which benefits the   
Survivor work. 

12 
Pray for sponsors to 
take on the monthly 
cost of translation for 
the Russian & Hebrew 
Survivor videos, into 

13 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Nahariya, Migdal ha 
Emek, Tzfat, Karmiel 
and Kiryat Yam. 

14 
Give thanks for the 
government agencies 
that work with AHI like 
the Dept of Welfare and 
Ministry Office. 

15 
Pray for children of Sur-
vivors to feel a great 
“need” to visit their par-
ents today; for    restora-
tion in their  families. 
 

16 
Pray for the families of 
each AHI board and 
staff members, for   
safety and protection. 

17 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Rishon le Zion, Kiryat 
Bialik and Beit Shean 

18 
Pray for favor and grace 
as we bring Veterans to 
meet Survivors.  Pray 
for healing through new 
relationships. 

19 
Pray and stand with 
AHI for an increase in 
funds to continue the 
work for the Survivors -
even to the last one. 

20 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Neszioyona, Kiryat 
Motzkin and Bnai’ 
Brak. 

21 
Give thanks for the  
Volunteers who come to 
Israel and love on the 
Survivors. 

22 
Pray for Survivors who 
are having difficulty 
sleeping or cannot   
handle the trauma due 
to PTSD. 

23 
Pray for AHI staff and 
volunteers to hear God’s 
voice clearly so we can 
follow His Heart and 
plans. 

24 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Akko, Arad, Ashdod, 
Kiryat Chaim and Bat 
Yam 

25 
Pray for safe travel as 
our internship students 
leave Beit Shalom and 
head home. 
 

26 
Pray for investors who 
will support the work 
with Survivors while we 
still have time to spend 
with  them. 

27 
Pray for strength and 
health of Survivors in 
Beer Sheva, Nazareth 
Ilit and Ashquelon. 

28 
Pray for the non-profit 
AHI located in Israel is 
given favor, respect, 
staff and success as we 
grow and train others. 

29 
Pray for Survivors to 
wish to know, have a 
desire to hear, how 
much HaShem loves 
them. 

30 
Pray for the Christian 
church to have a new 
revelation: Israel has 
not been replaced but 
remains #1. 

31 
Pray for volunteers who 
will arrive next month. 
Pray for more room to 
place volunteers and 
guests. 
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